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Thomas Harvey <assrj.scholarpublishing@gmail.com> Wed, Nov 24, 2021 at 3:53 PM
Reply-To: Thomas Harvey <assrj@scholarpublishing.org>
To: naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id

Dear Nanik Setyowati!
We are pleased to inform you that your manuscript titled “Survival Strategy of Street Children Who Do Not Occupy 
in Halfway House against Violence in the City of Surabaya through the Assistance of ALIT Foundation 
 ” is ACCEPTED for publication in Advances in Social Sciences Research Journal (ASSRJ).

You have moved to the next step of publication process. Prior to inclusion in the journal volume/issue, your article 
will be assigned a unique and permanent Digital Online Identifier (DOI) and will be made available online for 
citation and referencing. This Online First is a feature that lets you have your paper published within 5 working 
days of final submission and payment.

The publication is subjected to the payment of Article Publishing Fee which is £149.99 Pound Sterling (GBP) only, 
which can be paid securely by logging into your account on journal website. Please Click Here to Login. You will 
see a Payment Notification in the “Tasks” menu on top left corner of web page. A click on the notification will 
redirect you to the PayPal payment page.

Other payment options are; 

1. PayPal:
a. Pay the publication fee at apc@sseuk.org through your PayPal account. Please mention the Article 

ID ASSRJ-11284 in the order description.
b. Online Payment : Please Click Here, You will see a payment page at publisher’s website. In “Article 

Publishing Fee”, select “One Article 149.99 GBP”. Afterwards, please select the “Journal Name”, 
write your “Invoice ID” which is ASSRJ-11284 and then click the “Pay Now” button and follow on 
screen instructions

2. Credit/Debit Cards: You can use any major credit/debit card for secure payment. Please Click Here, You 
will see a payment page at publisher’s website. On the payment form, select “Journal Name” , write your 
“Invoice ID” which is ASSRJ-11284. In “Article Publishing Fee”, select “£149.99 GBP” then click the 
“Proceed” button and follow on screen instructions.

3. Wire Transfer: The details of bank account for online are as

        Account Title: Services for Science and Education Ltd
        Account Number: 36987868
        Sort Code: 30-97-57
        IBAN: GB56LOYD30975736987868
        SWIFT Code/BIC: LOYDGB2L 
        Bank: Lloydes Bank, United Kingdom 

(Please note down the manuscript ID “ASSRJ-11284" and use it to refer to your manuscript for future correspondence)
Do not hesitate to contact us if we can be of any assistance. 

Warm Regards

Thomas Harvey
Editorial Assistant
Advances in Social Sciences Research Journal
Service for Science and Education
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187 Brooklands Road, Hall Green
Birmingham, B288JP, United Kingdom

 

naniksetyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id> Thu, Nov 25, 2021 at 4:26 AM
To: Dian Sari Widadi <diansariwidadi@gmail.com>

Sent from my Samsung Galaxy smartphone.
[Quoted text hidden]

naniksetyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id> Thu, Nov 25, 2021 at 4:29 AM
To: helmi109@gmail.com

Sent from my Samsung Galaxy smartphone.

-------- Original message --------
From: Thomas Harvey <assrj.scholarpublishing@gmail.com>
Date: 11/24/21 3:53 PM (GMT+07:00)
To: naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id
Subject: Article Acceptance Report [ASSRJ-11284]

[Quoted text hidden]

naniksetyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id> Thu, Nov 25, 2021 at 6:17 AM
To: sarmini@unesa.ac.id

Sent from my Samsung Galaxy smartphone.

-------- Original message --------
From: Thomas Harvey <assrj.scholarpublishing@gmail.com>
Date: 11/24/21 3:53 PM (GMT+07:00)
To: naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id
Subject: Article Acceptance Report [ASSRJ-11284]

[Quoted text hidden]

Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id> Thu, Nov 25, 2021 at 6:11 PM
To: Thomas Harvey <assrj@scholarpublishing.org>

I cannot check on Task. It's said "Accessed Denied". I have paid. Please help process the journal. Thank you.
[Quoted text hidden]
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Thomas Harvey <assrj@scholarpublishing.org> Fri, Nov 26, 2021 at 2:01 AM
To: Raden Roro Nanik Setyowati <naniksetyowati@unesa.ac.id>

Dear Author!
We acknowledge your email for payment. We will let you know as soon as the accounts o"ce confirms 
the payment in our bank account and your article will be published online-first soon after that.

All the Best,

Thomas Harvey
Editorial Assistant
Advances in Social Sciences Research Journal
Services for Science and Education
Brooklands Road, Hall Green
Birmingham, B288JP, United Kingdom

[Quoted text hidden]
[Quoted text hidden]
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